
 
 
 
 

Partner Name and 
Address 

Partner Information Partner Contact Details Age 
Range  

BPS Management 
Ltd 
Baypoint  
Ramsgate Road 
Sandwich 
CT13 9QL 
 
10am – 2pm 
 
8 – 11 April 

Our Baypoint Holiday Camp offers your child a fun-filled, action-packed 
school holiday, delivered in a safe and supervised environment. We will 
offer multi-sports and activities, arts and crafts, nature walks, Zumba, yoga, 
nutritional talks, signposting for families and much more, in Kent's number 
one sporting venue. A selection of hot meals will be offered daily as part of 
our camp along with some free time to help children’s social interaction. 
We offer breakfast club with an early drop off from 8.30am for £5 per day. 
As well as the children being able to participate, we will also be running 
parent and child activities, classes and talks ensuring that you and your 
children leave our holiday clubs not only having had a great time but also 
informed on better health and wellbeing practices. 
• Registration opens at 9.30am, HAF begins at 10am - 2pm. Collection time 
is 2pm • Breakfast club opens at 8.30am for children (£5 per day) • Suitable 
clothing and footwear for sports activities • Change of clothes depending 
on weather. 

Lauren Bury 
 
01304 613022 
 
lauren@baypoint-
club.co.uk  
  
www.wearebaypoint.co.uk  
 

5 - 16 
years  
(up to 
18 
years 
for 
young 
people 
with 
SEND) 
 

Creation Station – 
Baypoint 
Baypoint 
Ramsgate Road 
Sandwich 
CT13 9QL 
 
10am – 2pm 
 
8 – 11 April 

The Creation Station Baypoint is an arts and crafts programme centred 
around the delivery of arts and crafts sessions to children and young 
people, alongside a range of physical activities to nurture physical health 
and wellbeing. We will deliver a range of different activities and sessions 
each day to give children and young people new and exciting opportunities 
to be creative, explore and develop. Our activities will include painting, tie 
dye printing, drawing, model making, clay, nature trails, bug hunts, family 
fun days and visits from services such as Kent Police and Monkton Nature 
Reserve.  Arts and crafts activities can improve your mental health and 
wellbeing, reduce stress and help maintain focus. Our sessions will be 
tailored to suit children and young people’s individual needs, inclusive of 
SEND. Each day all children and staff come together at lunch time for a 
warm meal, then some free time to help with their social interaction.  
 

Leah Paisley 
 
01304 800 067 
 
leah@baypoint-club.co.uk 
 
www.thecreationstation.co.
uk/baypoint  
 

www.wearebaypoint.co.uk  

5 – 16 
years 

mailto:lauren@baypoint-club.co.uk
mailto:lauren@baypoint-club.co.uk
http://www.wearebaypoint.co.uk/
mailto:leah@baypoint-club.co.uk
http://www.thecreationstation.co.uk/baypoint%20/
http://www.thecreationstation.co.uk/baypoint%20/
http://www.wearebaypoint.co.uk/


 
 
 
 

We will deliver our holiday camp from 10am to 2pm and it will be available 
to children from 5 to 16 years of age.  

Creation Station – 
Baypoint 
Betteshanger Park 
Sandwich Road 
Deal 
CT14 0BF 
 
10am – 2pm 
 
8 – 11 April 
 
 

The Creation Station Baypoint (Deal) is an arts and crafts programme 
centred around the delivery of arts and crafts sessions to children and 
young people, alongside a range of physical activities to nurture physical 
health and wellbeing.  We will deliver a range of different activities and 
sessions each day to give children and young people new and exciting 
opportunities to be creative, explore and develop. Our activities will include 
painting, tie dye printing, drawing, model making, clay, nature trails, bug 
hunts, family fun days, forest school days, exploring the outside play area 
and different outdoor activities. Arts and crafts activities can improve your 
mental health and wellbeing, reduce stress and help maintain focus.  Our 
sessions will be tailored to suit children and young people’s individual 
needs, inclusive of SEND. Each day all children and staff come together at 
lunchtime for a warm meal, then some free time to help with their social 
interaction.  
 
We will deliver our holiday camp from 10am to 2pm and it will be available 
to children from 5 to 16 years of age.  

Leah Paisley 
 
01304 800 067 
 
leah@baypoint-club.co.uk 
 
www.thecreationstation.co.
uk/baypoint   
 
www.wearebaypoint.co.uk  

5 – 16 
years 

Dynamic Sports 
Coaching 
Green Park 
Community Primary 
School  
The Linces 
CT16 2BN 
 
10am – 2pm 
 
2 – 5 April 
 

Our programme offers a variety of sports and games that children will learn 
and play. We will have workshops including yoga, fitness and nutrition as 
well as playing a variety of sports. We will also run arts and crafts 
afternoons as well with Easter themes. 
 

Joe Reeves 
 
07771 881452 

 
Joe.dynamicsports@gmail.
com  
 
www.dynamic-sports-
coaching.com 

5 – 11 
years 

mailto:leah@baypoint-club.co.uk
http://www.thecreationstation.co.uk/baypoint%20/
http://www.thecreationstation.co.uk/baypoint%20/
http://www.wearebaypoint.co.uk/
mailto:Joe.dynamicsports@gmail.com
mailto:Joe.dynamicsports@gmail.com
http://www.dynamic-sports-coaching.com/
http://www.dynamic-sports-coaching.com/


 
 
 
 

Dynamic Sports 
Coaching 
Sandown School 
Golf Road 
Deal 
CT14 6PY 
 
10am – 2pm 
 
8 – 11 April 

Our programme offers a variety of sports and games that children will learn 
and play. We will have workshops including yoga, fitness and nutrition as 
well as playing a variety of sports. We will also run arts + crafts afternoons 
as well with Easter themes. 
 

Joe Reeves 
 
07771 881452 

 
Joe.dynamicsports@gmail.
com  
 
www.dynamic-sports-
coaching.com 

5 – 11 
years 

Eythorne Elvington 
Community Primary 
School 
Adelaide Road 
Eythorne 
Dover 
CT15 4AN 
 
9am – 1pm 
 
8 – 11 April 

The HAF programme, will take place in a rural primary school setting, 
activities will include, arts, crafts, music, sport & forest school activities.  
The staff on site have experience of working with pupils with SEN & those 
young people are welcomed to attend sessions, prior consultations may be 
sought with parents to understand the young person’s needs.  The school 
has a forest school onsite and this will be used for activities during the HAF 
programme.  
 

Neil Garvey 
 
01304830376 
 
admin@eythorne-
elvington.kent.sch.uk  
 

4 – 11 
years 

Football Fun 
Factory 2 
(Community 079) 
Sandwich Leisure 
Centre 
Deal Road 
Sandwich 
CT13 0BU 
 
8.45am – 3.30pm 

The Football Fun Factory was created to provide incredible childhood 
football experiences for boys and girls of all ages and ability levels. Our 
mission is to use the nation’s passion for football as a vehicle for child 
development. We believe that the focus should not be simply on 
development or progression… we should be focusing on having fun! Our 
ethos is all about creating an incredible environment where children can 
express themselves, play, make friends and have fun! 

 

Holly Rye 
 
07912 014067 

louandholly@thefootballfun
factory.co.uk  
 
www.thefootballfunfactory.
co.uk  

5 – 11 
years 

mailto:Joe.dynamicsports@gmail.com
mailto:Joe.dynamicsports@gmail.com
http://www.dynamic-sports-coaching.com/
http://www.dynamic-sports-coaching.com/
mailto:admin@eythorne-elvington.kent.sch.uk
mailto:admin@eythorne-elvington.kent.sch.uk
mailto:louandholly@thefootballfunfactory.co.uk
mailto:louandholly@thefootballfunfactory.co.uk
http://www.thefootballfunfactory.co.uk/
http://www.thefootballfunfactory.co.uk/


 
 
 
 

 
2 – 5 April 

Kaleidascope 
Childcare Ltd 
Ackholt Road 
Aylesham 
Dover 
CT3 3AS 
 
10am – 2pm 
 
2 – 5 April 

Our holiday camp offers your child a fun filled, action packed school 
holiday, delivered in a safe and supervised environment. With exciting 
visitors, multi sports and activities, arts and crafts, day trips, nature walks, 
den / camp building, group games, nutritional talks, family fun day, pre-teen 
hub hangout area and much, much more. Our sessions will be tailored to 
suit children and young people’s induvial needs, inclusive of SEND.  
Here at Kaleidascope we are more than just a sports and crafts camp, we 
are a whole camp experience: our main aim is to encourage the 
development of new friendships and help build confidence in the children 
who attend. By sending your child to our camps, whether for one day or for 
every week of the holidays, they will become part of our Kaleidascope 
family. A family environment where they will feel safe and comfortable and 
most importantly will be encouraged to be themselves.  
For us, it is about their smiles, their laughter and watching them create 
bonds and memories with the friends they have made. 
 

Bailey Johanson  
Bonnie Read-Noakes 
 
01304 842 363 
 
kaleidascopekidsclub@outl
ook.com  
 
WWW.KALEIDASCOPEC
HILDCARE.COM  
 

4 – 11 
years 

West Faversham 
Community 
Association 
Aylesham Welfare 
Leisure Centre 
Spinney Lane 
Aylesham 
CT3 3BE 
 
11am – 3pm 
 
2 – 5 April 
8 – 11 April 

Fun holiday club in a leisure centre which includes inside themed activities, 
games, arts and crafts, cooking and fun, outside games and sports 
including football, basketball and sports day.  
For more information on activities offered, please contact the programme 
organisers directly. 

Victoria Blake 
 
 01795537321 
 
 
v.blake@westfavershamca
.org  
  

5 – 11  
years 

mailto:kaleidascopekidsclub@outlook.com
mailto:kaleidascopekidsclub@outlook.com
http://www.kaleidascopechildcare.com/
http://www.kaleidascopechildcare.com/
mailto:v.blake@westfavershamca.org
mailto:v.blake@westfavershamca.org


 
 
 
 

 


