
 
 
 
 

Partner Name and 
Address 

Partner Information Partner Contact Details Age 
Range  

Active Life Ltd 
(Fusion Lifestyle) 
 
Bay Sports Arena 
Bullockstone Road 
Herne Bay  
Kent 
CT6 7NS 
 
10am – 3pm 
 
2 – 5 April 
8 – 12 April 

Give your kids, two action-packed weeks over the Easter holidays at 
the Bay Sports Arena for children aged 5-11 in a safe and social 
environment.  
Activities include dodgeball, football, roller skating, inflatables, arts 
and crafts workshops and children will be provided with a delicious 
and nutritious lunch. Our sessions will be tailored to suit children and 
young people’s individual needs for a happy Easter holiday. 
 

David Garlick – Centre Manager 
 
01227 366921 
 
baysports-
sales@activelifeltd.co.uk 
 
https://activelifeltd.co.uk/  
 
https://www.facebook.com/bays
portsarena/  
 

5 - 11 
years 

BPS Management 
Ltd 
Canterbury Academy 
Trust 
Knight Avenue 
Canterbury 
CT2 8QA 
 
10am – 2pm 
 
8 - 11 April 
 

For more information on activities offered, please contact the 
programme organisers directly. 

Lauren Bury 
 
01304 613022 
 
lauren@baypoint-club.co.uk  
 

www.wearebaypoint.co.uk  
 

5 – 16 
years 
 
(up to 
18 
years 
old with 
SEND) 

BPS Management 
Ltd 
Spires Academy 
Bredlands Lane 

For more information on activities offered, please contact the 
programme organisers directly. 

Lauren Bury 
 
01304 613022 
 

5 – 16 
years 
 
(up to 

mailto:baysports-sales@activelifeltd.co.uk
mailto:baysports-sales@activelifeltd.co.uk
https://activelifeltd.co.uk/
https://www.facebook.com/baysportsarena/
https://www.facebook.com/baysportsarena/
mailto:lauren@baypoint-club.co.uk
http://www.wearebaypoint.co.uk/


 
 
 
 

Sturry 
Canterbury 
CT2 0HD 
 
10am – 2pm 
 
8 – 11 April 
 

lauren@baypoint-club.co.uk  
 

www.wearebaypoint.co.uk  
  
 

18 
years 
old with 
SEND) 

Canterbury Academy 
Trust 
Canterbury Academy 
Trust,  
Night Avenue, 
Canterbury,  
Kent 
CT2 8QA 
 
10am – 2pm 
 
2 – 5 April 
 

Please contact the Programme directly for more information. Andy Trill 
 
01227 463 971 (362) 
 
atrill@canterbury.kent.sch.uk  

11 – 16 
years 

Inclusive Sport 
Herne Bay Junior 
School 
Kings Road 
Herne Bay 
CT6 5DA 
 
10am – 2pm  
 
2 – 5 April 

The Inclusive Sport HAF Programmes are delivered at local schools 
to provide an inclusive, safe and caring environment where children 
can have fun, make friends and take part in memorable experiences. 
There will be a wide range of activities available to ensure all children 
enjoy their time with us. We offer sports like football, dodgeball, 
rounders and many more! There will be daily arts and crafts 
workshops delivered by art specialists as well as the chance to enjoy 
drama, yoga and fitness and wellbeing sessions throughout the 
programme. The children will get the chance to take part in healthy 
living and cooking workshops as well as being provided with a daily 

Tom 
 
01227 202513 
 
info@inclusivesport.net  

5 – 16 
years  
 
(up to 
18 
years 
old with 
SEND) 

mailto:lauren@baypoint-club.co.uk
http://www.wearebaypoint.co.uk/
mailto:atrill@canterbury.kent.sch.uk
mailto:info@inclusivesport.net


 
 
 
 

8 – 12 April delicious and nutritious lunch. 

Inclusive Sport 
Reculver Church of 
England Primary 
School 
Hillborough  
Herne Bay 
CT9 3RA 
 
10am – 2pm  
 
2 – 5 April 
8 – 12 April 

The Inclusive Sport Reculver Primary Camp will provide an inclusive, 
safe and caring environment where children can have fun, make 
friends and take part in memorable experiences. There will be a wide 
range of activities available to ensure all children will enjoy their time 
with us. We offer sports like football, dodgeball, rounders and many 
more! There will be daily arts and crafts workshops delivered by art 
specialists as well as the chance to enjoy drama, yoga and fitness 
and wellbeing sessions throughout the programme. The children will 
get the chance to take part in healthy living and cooking workshops 
as well as being provided with a daily, delicious and nutritious lunch. 
 

Tom 
 
01227 202513 
 
info@inclusivesport.net  

5 – 11 
years 

Inclusive Sport 
Whitstable and 
Seasalter Endowed 
Church of England 
Junior School 
High Street 
Whitstable 
CT5 1AY 
 
10am – 2pm  
 
2 – 5 April 
8 – 12 April 

The Inclusive Sport HAF Programmes are delivered at local schools 
to provide an inclusive, safe, and caring environment where children 
can have fun, make friends and take part in memorable experiences. 
There will be a wide range of activities available to ensure all children 
enjoy their time with us. We offer sports like football, dodgeball, 
rounders and many more! There will be daily arts and crafts 
workshops delivered by art specialists as well as the chance to enjoy 
drama, yoga and fitness and wellbeing sessions throughout the 
programme. The children will get the chance to take part in healthy 
living and cooking workshops as well as being provided with a daily 
delicious and nutritious lunch. 

Tom 
 
01227 202513 
 
info@inclusivesport.net  

5 – 16 
years 
 
(up to 
18 
years 
old with 
SEND) 

Khickster 
Entertainment Ltd 
Simon Langton Girls’ 
Grammar School 
Canterbury 

Khickster Entertainment welcome all children aged 4-16 to our multi 
activity day camps. We have a huge focus on developing children’s 
self-esteem and social confidence through a wide range of activities 
including but not limited to, arts and crafts, circus skills, sports, 
theatre, dance, music and woodland walks. Our final day is a 

Kimberley Hicks 
 
07871 571389 
 
info@khicksterentertainment.co.

4 – 16 
years 

mailto:info@inclusivesport.net
mailto:info@inclusivesport.net
mailto:info@khicksterentertainment.co.uk


 
 
 
 

CT1 3EW 
 
9am – 4pm 
 
2 – 5 April 
8 – 12 April 
 

celebration day in which we always have a new activity or visitor as 
part of our programme to end the week with a high. We hope to 
develop friendships and welcome all children and their families to join 
our Khickster family. 

uk  
 
www.khicksterentertainment.co.
uk  

Khickster 
Entertainment Ltd 
Briary Primary School 
Greenhill Road 
Herne Bay 
CT6 7RS 
 
9am – 3pm 
 
2 – 5 April 
8 – 12 April 

Khickster Entertainment welcome all children aged 4-12 to our multi 
activity day camps. We have a huge focus on developing children’s 
self-esteem and social confidence through a wide range of activities 
including but not limited to, arts and crafts, circus skills, sports, 
theatre, dance, music and woodland walks. Our final day is a 
celebration day in which we always have a new activity or visitor as 
part of our programme to end the week with a high. We hope to 
develop friendships and welcome all children and their families to join 
our Khickster family. 

Kimberley Hicks 
 
07871 571389 
 
info@khicksterentertainment.co.
uk  
 
www.khicksterentertainment.co.
uk 

4 – 16 
years 

PACE 
 
Wincheap Foundation 
Primary School 
Hollow Lane 
Canterbury 
CT1 3SD 
 
9am – 1pm 
 
8 - 11 April 

For more information on activities offered, please contact the 
programme organisers directly. 

Pat Sutcliffe 
 
07827019362 
 
patsutcliffe@pacesports.co.uk  
 
www.pacesports.co.uk 

4 – 11 
years 

Primary Sports 
Giants 

A fun and inclusive Sports and Craft Activity Camp led by 
experienced and friendly staff where children can enjoy a range of 

Tom 
 

5 – 14 
years 

mailto:info@khicksterentertainment.co.uk
http://www.khicksterentertainment.co.uk/
http://www.khicksterentertainment.co.uk/
mailto:info@khicksterentertainment.co.uk
mailto:info@khicksterentertainment.co.uk
http://www.khicksterentertainment.co.uk/
http://www.khicksterentertainment.co.uk/
mailto:patsutcliffe@pacesports.co.uk
http://www.pacesports.co.uk/


 
 
 
 

St Anselm’s School 
Old Dover Road 
Canterbury 
CT1 3EN  
 
9am – 3pm 
 
 
2 – 5 April 
8 – 11 April 
 
 

activities such as arts and crafts, indoor and outdoor sports and 
activities, forest school, woodwork and upcycling materials.  We 
always have multiple activities on offer which allows children to 
choose from. This ensures they have options and we believe this 
increases participation and allows children to feel more welcome. For 
example, we have a dedicated Lego and art room for break-out 
activities.  
Two areas of focus will be on developing eating and cooking 
knowledge and skills, children will prepare meals and help to cook the 
meals in an outdoor environment for example over open 
fires. Secondly, there will be a focus on crafts and green woodwork 
skills so children can learn and develop skills for later life so they can 
become more independent and learn how to manage risks in a safe 
and methodical way.  
For the Easter camp we will be piloting our ‘Break & Create’ element 
for the camp for older children only.  Children will be able to learn 
woodworking skills and make practical items out of reclaimed 
timber. We would like to take them on a day excursion too.  

07795546455 
 
Info@primarysportsgiants.co.uk 

 
14 – 18 
years 

Sunshine Children’s 
Centre 
Sunshine Children’s 
Centre 
The Hippodrome 
Kings Road 
Herne Bay 
CT6 5BQ 
 
9am – 1pm 
 
2 – 5 April 
8 – 11 April 

For more information on activities offered, please contact the 
programme organisers directly. 

Fiona Rennie 
 
07561851212 

 
info@sunshinechildrenscentre.u
k  

4 – 11 
years 

mailto:info@sunshinechildrenscentre.uk
mailto:info@sunshinechildrenscentre.uk


 
 
 
 

 
 

Teamtheme Kent 
Blean Primary School 
Whitstable Road 
Canterbury 
CT2 9ED 
 
9am – 4pm 
 
9 – 12 April 

Our committed staff bring a wealth of sporting experience, and our 
courses reflect these with a variety of specialised sport-specific 
activities and multi-sports skills are on offer on a daily basis.  
 
All activities are age appropriate for each group with the following on 
offer -  
 
Archery, Athletics, Badminton, Basketball, Cricket, Dance, Dodgeball, 
Fencing, Fitness, Football, Foursquare, Gymnastics, Handball, 
Hockey, Lacrosse, Multi-Skills, Netball, Nerf, OAA, Rugby, Speed 
Stacks, Taekwondo, Table Tennis, Tennis, Tri-Golf, Ultimate Frisbee, 
Volleyball, Yoga & Zorbing.  
 
We will also be delivering Arts & Crafts, Music, Cooking (Wasted 
Kitchen & Macknade) & Forest School workshops across each week.  
 
We also have a variety of Theme Days which give the children (and 
coaches!) an opportunity to dress up for the day. Details of these will 
be given to parents in advance as part of the camp welcome email 
that details the child's individual coach and other handy need to know 
info for their child's time with us on camp. 

Gary Shackleford 
 
07938 575124 
 
info@teamthemekent.co.uk 
 
https://www.teamthemekent.co.
uk  
 

5 – 16 
years 

Teamtheme Kent 
Chartham Primary 
School 
Shalmsford Street 
Canterbury 
CT4 7QN 
 
9am – 4pm 

Our committed staff bring a wealth of sporting experience, and our 
courses reflect these with a variety of specialised sport-specific 
activities and multi-sports skills on offer daily basis.  
 
All activities are age appropriate for each group with the following on 
offer -  
 
Archery, Athletics, Badminton, Basketball, Cricket, Dance, Dodgeball, 

Gary Shackleford 
 
07938 575124 
 
info@teamthemekent.co.uk 
 
https://www.teamthemekent.co.
uk 

5 – 16 
years 

mailto:info@teamthemekent.co.uk
https://www.teamthemekent.co.uk/
https://www.teamthemekent.co.uk/
mailto:info@teamthemekent.co.uk
https://www.teamthemekent.co.uk/
https://www.teamthemekent.co.uk/


 
 
 
 

 
9 – 12 April 

Fencing, Fitness, Football, Foursquare, Gymnastics, Handball, 
Hockey, Lacrosse, Multi-Skills, Netball, Nerf, OAA, Rugby, Speed 
Stacks, Taekwondo, Table Tennis, Tennis, Tri-Golf, Ultimate Frisbee, 
Volleyball, Yoga & Zorbing.  
 
We will also be delivering Arts & Crafts, Music, Cooking (Wasted 
Kitchen & Macknade) & Forest School workshops across each week.  
 
We also have a variety of Theme Days which give the children (and 
coaches!) an opportunity to dress up for the day. Details of these will 
be given to parents in advance as part of the camp welcome email 
that details the child's individual coach and other handy need to know 
info for their child's time with us on camp. 

 
  
 

Teamtheme Kent 
Joy Lane Primary 
School 
Joy Lane 
Whitstable 
CT5 4LT 
 
9am – 4pm 
 
9 – 12 April 

Our committed staff bring a wealth of sporting experience, and our 
courses reflect these with a variety of specialised sport-specific 
activities and multi-sports skills on offer daily basis.  
 
All activities are age appropriate for each group with the following on 
offer -  
 
Archery, Athletics, Badminton, Basketball, Cricket, Dance, Dodgeball, 
Fencing, Fitness, Football, Foursquare, Gymnastics, Handball, 
Hockey, Lacrosse, Multi-Skills, Netball, Nerf, OAA, Rugby, Speed 
Stacks, Taekwondo, Table Tennis, Tennis, Tri-Golf, Ultimate Frisbee, 
Volleyball, Yoga & Zorbing.  
 
We will also be delivering Arts & Crafts, Music, Cooking (Wasted 
Kitchen & Macknade) & Forest School workshops across each week.  
 
We also have a variety of Theme Days which give the children (and 
coaches!) an opportunity to dress up for the day. Details of these will 

Gary Shackleford 
 
07938 575124 
 
info@teamthemekent.co.uk 
 
https://www.teamthemekent.co.
uk 
  
  
 

5 – 16 
years 

mailto:info@teamthemekent.co.uk
https://www.teamthemekent.co.uk/
https://www.teamthemekent.co.uk/


 
 
 
 

be given to parents in advance as part of the camp welcome email 
that details the child's individual coach and other handy need to know 
info for their child's time with us on camp. 

Teamtheme Kent 
St Stephens Academy 
Hales Drive 
Canterbury 
CT2 7AB 
 
9am – 4pm 
 
9 – 12 April 

Our committed staff bring a wealth of sporting experience, and our 
courses reflect these with a variety of specialised sport-specific 
activities and multi-sports skills on offer daily basis.  
 
All activities are age appropriate for each group with the following on 
offer -  
 
Archery, Athletics, Badminton, Basketball, Cricket, Dance, Dodgeball, 
Fencing, Fitness, Football, Foursquare, Gymnastics, Handball, 
Hockey, Lacrosse, Multi-Skills, Netball, Nerf, OAA, Rugby, Speed 
Stacks, Taekwondo, Table Tennis, Tennis, Tri-Golf, Ultimate Frisbee, 
Volleyball, Yoga & Zorbing.  
 
We will also be delivering Arts & Crafts, Music, Cooking (Wasted 
Kitchen & Macknade) & Forest School workshops across each week.  
 
We also have a variety of Theme Days which give the children (and 
coaches!) an opportunity to dress up for the day. Details of these will 
be given to parents in advance as part of the camp welcome email 
that details the child's individual coach and other handy need to know 
info for their child's time with us on camp. 

Gary Shackleford 
 
07938 575124 
 
info@teamthemekent.co.uk 
 
https://www.teamthemekent.co.
uk 
 
 

5 – 16  
years 

The Archbishops 
School 
PGL Marchants Hill 
Tilford Road 
Beacon Hill 
Hindhead 
GU26 6RF 

On Friday afternoon the children will meet at school and travel to the 
centre by coach. On arrival they will settle into their accommodation 
and then will have a hot dinner before the evening outdoor adventure 
activity. In the morning the children will enjoy a nutritional buffet 
breakfast with hot and cold options before being split into 2 groups. 
One group will take part in classroom-based activities while the other 
group take part in outward bound activities. The two groups will meet 

Mrs S Tilstone 
 
01227 765805 
 
stilstone@archbishops.kent.sch.
uk  

11 – 16 
years 

mailto:info@teamthemekent.co.uk
https://www.teamthemekent.co.uk/
https://www.teamthemekent.co.uk/
mailto:stilstone@archbishops.kent.sch.uk
mailto:stilstone@archbishops.kent.sch.uk


 
 
 
 

 
Residential 
 
5 – 7 April 

up for lunch (hot and cold options available) and then swap over for 
the afternoon. They will then have a hot dinner before another 
exciting outdoor adventure activity. The next day will follow the same 
pattern before the students are returned to school by coach after their 
evening meal. 

The Rockstar 
Experience 
St Mary’s Retreat Hall 
Clarence Road 
Herne Bay 
CT6 5TH 
 
10am – 2pm 
 
2 – 5 April 

“The Rockstar Experience: World Adventure Series” is aimed at 
younger children as it explores different cultural approaches to 
celebrations such as Easter and Christmas, as well as teaching about 
environmentalism around the globe and how our behaviour can 
impact the world around us. Through song, dance, arts and crafts we 
create a colourful show that informs what we can do to take 
responsibility for the health of our local and global environments and 
to respect our many wonderful differences. Families, friend and other 
guests are able to attend and enjoy the show each week. 

Jacob Bane 
 
07865 245442 
 
rockstar@rseuk.org  
 
www.facebook.com/rseuk  

5 – 11 
years 

TSC Kent Ltd 
Parkside Primary 
School 
Tennyson Avenue 
Sturry 
Canterbury 
CT1 1EP 
 
9am – 1pm 
 
2 – 5 April 

For more information on activities offered, please contact the 
programme organisers directly. 

Tom Holmes 
 
07305 381539 
 
canterbury@tscoaching.co.uk   
 
www.tscoaching.co.uk  
 

5 – 11 
years 

TSC Kent Ltd 
Swalecliffe Community 
Primary School 
Bridgfield Road 
Whitstable 

For more information on activities offered, please contact the 
programme organisers directly. 

Tom Holmes 
 
07305 381539 
 
canterbury@tscoaching.co.uk   

5 – 11 
years 

mailto:rockstar@rseuk.org
http://www.facebook.com/rseuk
mailto:canterbury@tscoaching.co.uk
http://www.tscoaching.co.uk/
mailto:canterbury@tscoaching.co.uk


 
 
 
 

Kent 
CT5 2PH 
 
9am – 1pm 
 
2 – 5 April 

 
www.tscoaching.co.uk  
 

 

http://www.tscoaching.co.uk/

